

BID OPENING TABULATION

SAWYER MANOR/TREVITT HEIGHTS (RAD)

— RENOVATIONS —

Tuesday, October 25, 2016 @ 2:00 PM

ARCHITECT / ENGINEER ESTIMATED COST\$N/A

CODES FOR REQUIRED DOCUMENTS

Sealed envelope, labeled "Bid Documents" with project name, bidder's Name and address, date, and time of bid opening, 1 original and 1 copy included inside envelope I

Bid Form #1 - Form of Addendum.....1

Bid Form #2 - Form of Bid (including EEO Compliance Certificate).....2

Bid Form #3 - Form of Non-Collusive Affidavit3

Bid Form #4 - Form of Bid Bond.....4

Bid Form #5 - Form of MBE Participation Compliance (Includes Forms 5A – Sub/ Supplier, 5B – Commitment, 5C – Good Faith).....5

Bid Form #6 - Previous Participation Certificate HUD Form 25306

Bid Form #7 - Form of Bidder's Qualifications (Includes 7A – Previous Projects).....7

Bid Form #8 - Form of Bidders Financial Statement8

Bid Form #9 - Form of Section 3 Requirements Compliance.....9

Bid Form #10 - Form of Certification for Drug-Free Workplace 10

Bid Form #11 - Form of Subcontractor & Material Supplier Declaration (to be provided by lowest & best bidder) 11

BIDDER'S NAME & ADDRESS	BASE BID PRICE & ALTERNATES	CODES FOR REQUIRED BID DOCUMENTS											
		BID DOCUMENT VERIFICATION											
		I	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10	11
Tri-State Renovations, Inc. 1895 S. High Street Columbus OH 43207	Bid #1: \$5,900,216.00 Bid #2: \$340,411.00 Bid #3: No Bid Combo: \$6,180,627.00 <i>(1,2 Only) (Not Valid)</i> U.P. #1: \$40.00 U.P. #2: \$37.00 U.P. #3: \$35.00 U.P. #4: \$294.00 U.P. #5: \$529.00 ALT #1: No Bid ALT #2: \$61,107.00	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓ 19.7%	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Palmetto Construction Services, LLC 892 Scott Street Columbus, OH 43222	Bid #1: \$6,494,677.00 Bid #2: \$293,000.00 Bid #3: \$200,000.00 Combo: \$6,913,677.00 U.P. #1: \$4.25 U.P. #2: \$3.50 U.P. #3: \$2.25 U.P. #4: \$300.00 U.P. #5: \$575.00 ALT #1: \$66,200.00 ALT #2: \$60,500.00	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓ 20% <i>Not Correct 9% Per Bid Doc</i>	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓

Gibraltar Construction 42 Hudson Street Annapolis MD 21401	Bid #1:	\$7,074,000.00	I	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10	11
	Bid #2:	No Bid												
	Bid #3:	No Bid												
	Combo:	No Bid												
	U.P. #1:	\$5.00	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
	U.P. #2:	\$10.00												
	U.P. #3:	\$6.00												
	U.P. #4:	\$180.00						1.3%						
	U.P. #5:	\$300.00												
	ALT #1:	No Bid												
ALT #2:	\$48,000.00													
S&L Specialty Contracting, Inc. 315 S. Franklin Street Syracuse, NY 13202	Bid #1:	\$7,875,000.00	I	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10	11
	Bid #2:	\$293,000.00												
	Bid #3:	No Bid												
	Combo:	No Bid												
	U.P. #1:	\$8.00	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
	U.P. #2:	\$2.00												
	U.P. #3:	\$1.50												
	U.P. #4:	\$531.00						20.1%						
	U.P. #5:	\$745.00												
	ALT #1:	No Bid												
ALT #2:	\$50,600.00													
R.W. Setterlin Building Company 560 Harmon Avenue Columbus, OH 43223	Bid #1:	\$8,700,000.00	I	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10	11
	Bid #2:	\$654,000.00												
	Bid #3:	\$520,000.00												
	Combo:	\$9,270,000.00												
	U.P. #1:	\$10.00	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
	U.P. #2:	\$5.00												
	U.P. #3:	\$5.00												
	U.P. #4:	\$600.00						8.5%						
	U.P. #5:	\$1,100.00												
	ALT #1:	\$85,000.00												
ALT #2:	\$80,000.00													
2k General Company, Inc. 19 Gruber Street, Building B Delaware OH 43015	Bid #1:	\$9,030,000.00	I	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10	11
	Bid #2:	\$385,600.00												
	Bid #3:	No Bid												
	Combo:	\$9,565,000.00												
	U.P. #1:	\$4.00	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
	U.P. #2:	\$3.00												
	U.P. #3:	\$4.00												
	U.P. #4:	\$357.00												
	U.P. #5:	\$700.00						TBD %						
	ALT #1:	\$80,000.00												
ALT #2:	\$50,000.00													